
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1
$48,415.00 $10,345.50 no bid

2
no bid no bid $54,970.00 

3
$109,701.00 $142,500.00 no bid

4
$41,450.00 no bid $39,968.00 

5
$44,434.00 no bid $36,492.00 

6
no bid no bid no bid

7
$9,198.00 $3,598.20 no bid

8
$115,794.00 no bid $97,526.00 

9

10

Total Price $368,992.00 Total Price $156,443.70 Total Price $228,956.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $0.00 

Bid Solicitation     

Date:   12/18/24

Item Description

Material Handling and Cleaning 

Equipment

BID TABULATION

BIDDER: Atlas Material Handling
Global Equipment 

Company, Inc. Octane Forklifts, Inc.

Bid Open  

Date:  1/16/25
 Description:  IFB No. 157022

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed .
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