
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 1
$10,415,000.00 $11,140,000.00 No Bid No Bid

2
$0.00 $0.00 - -

3
$0.00 $0.00 - -

4
$0.00 $0.00 - -

5
$0.00 $0.00 - -

6
$0.00 $0.00 - -

7
$0.00 $0.00 - -

8
$0.00 $0.00 - -

9
$0.00 $0.00 - -

10 $0.00 $0.00 - -

Total Price $10,415,000.00 Total Price $11,140,000.00 Total Price No Bid Total Price No Bid

Item Description

GRAND TOTAL

BID TABULATION

BIDDER: Aldridge Electric, Inc. John Burns Construction 
Company Michels Power, Inc. George Allen Construction

Bid Open  
Date:  10/19/21

Description: Construction Services to Upgrade Metra’s Matteson 
Substation’s Load Capacity  IFB No.: 86915 Bid Solicitation     

Date:   8/30/21

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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