MELa"

BID TABULATION

S . . Bid Solicitation A . . Bid Open
Description: Service Vehicles, Groups I, I, 111 IV and V IFB No. 71169 Date: 4/6/16 Specification Nos.: Various Date: 4/27/16
BIDDER: Terry's Ford Roesch Ford TNT Equipment Auto Truck Group EJ Equipment
Line |Qty. Item Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
1 GROUP | . .
$208,000.00 No-Bid $220,000.00 $196,734.00 No-Bid
2
3 GROUP II . .
$392,400.00 $398,256.00 No-Bid $384,588.00 No-Bid
4
5 GROURP Il
$424,800.00 $432,404.00 $470,000.00 $380,568.00 $397,688.00
6
7 GROUP IV
$1,629,600.00 $1,676,850.00 $2,030,000.00 $1,498,056.00 $1,521,100.00
8
9 GROUP V . .
$244,000.00 No-Bid $278,000.00 $231,258.00 No-Bid
10

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.




