
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 1
$32,320.00 $32,320.00 No-Bid No-Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

2 1
No-Bid No-Bid $45,513.00 $45,513.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

4
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

8
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

9
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
Total Price $32,320.00 Total Price $45,513.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $0.00 Total Price $0.00 

Description:  Locomotive Fuel Tanks for F40PH-3 & MP36PH-3S IFB Nos.: 50262 & 50263 Bid Solicitation
Date: 09/14/15

BID TABULATION

BIDDER: Progress Rail Services Motive Power, Inc.

Bid Open
Date: 10/08/15Specification Nos.:  N/A

Item Description

Locomotive Fuel Tank for F40PH-3

Locomotive Fuel Tank for MP36PH-3S

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purpoases only, a responsiveness and responisbility determination must be performed.


