
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1
$9,884,700.00 $9,884,700.00 $9,378,450.00 $9,302,400.00 $10,246,500.00 

2
$8,185,580.00 $8,185,580.00 $3,950,830.00 $2,687,360.00 No Bid

3
 No Bid No bid $650,048.00 $487,845.00 No Bid

4
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

8
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

9
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price

Bid Solicitation     
Date: 9/25/19

Item Description

GROUP A

GROUP B

GROUP C

BID TABULATION

BIDDER: MANSFIELD OIL MANSFIELD (Alternate) Colonial Oil Industries, Inc. Pinkerton Oil Company Petroleum Traders Corp

Bid Open  
Date: 10/17/19 Description: Diesel / Gasoline Fueling of Metra's Remote Storage 

Tanks & Direct Fueling into Locomotives  IFB No. 49455

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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