
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1

2

3
 

4
No Bid No Bid $181,555.00 $118,420.00 

5
No Bid No Bid No Bid $129,259.00 

6
No Bid No Bid $74,897.00 $65,730.00 

7
No Bid $480,100.00 No Bid $0.00 

8
$78,180.00 $109,168.00 No Bid $0.00 

9

10

Total Price $78,180.00 Total Price $589,268.00 Total Price $256,452.00 Total Price $313,409.00 Total Price

Bid Solicitation     
Date:   10/26/2021

Gorup 01- Offset Prianing

Group 02- Envelope Printing

Group 03- High Volume Copy Services

Group 04- Posters and Sign Printing

Group 05- Public and Employee Timetables 
Printing 

Item Description

Five Groups of Printing Services 

3-years/$5,000,000.00

BID TABULATION

BIDDER: Cardinal ColorGroup Graphic Arts Studio One Step, Inc.
Werner Printing & 

Engraving

Bid Open  
Date:  11/19/2021 Description:  Five Groups of Printing Services  IFB No.  92162

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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