
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price

1 1
No Bid No Bid $634,330.00 $634,330.00 $516,714.50 $516,714.50 No Bid No Bid $424,550.00 $424,550.00 $415,500.00 $415,500.00 $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 1
No Bid No Bid $634,330.00 $634,330.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $415,500.00 $415,500.00 $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 1
No Bid No Bid $634,330.00 $634,330.00 $516,714.50 $516,714.50 $456,200.00 $456,200.00 No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid $661,897.50 $661,897.50 No Bid

4 1
No Bid No Bid $634,330.00 $634,330.00 $516,714.50 $516,714.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $415,500.00 $415,500.00 $572,306.00 $572,306.00 $580,598.00 $580,598.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $415,500.00 $415,500.00 $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $468,797.50 

6
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $516,714.50 $516,714.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid $661,897.50 $661,897.50 No Bid

8 1
$395,350.00 $395,350.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 1
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $516,714.50 $516,714.50 No Bid No Bid $424,550.00 $424,550.00 No bid No Bid $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 1
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid $572,306.00 $572,306.00 No Bid No Bid $661,897.50 $661,897.50 No Bid

Total Price $395,350.00 Total Price $2,537,320.00 Total Price $2,583,572.50 Total Price $456,200.00 Total Price $849,100.00 Total Price $1,662,000.00 Total Price $5,723,060.00 Total Price $580,598.00 Total Price $1,985,692.50 Total Price

Item Description

Group A

Group B

Group C

Group D

BID TABULATION

BIDDER:
A Tire County Services  

Inc. Bus & Truck of Chicago Freeway Ford Fulton Desplanes Garage Kiesters Garage

Bid Open

Date: 4/10/23

 Specification Nos.:  FM-19-

100 

Description:  Preventive Maintenance and Repairs for Gasoline 

Vehicles
IFB Nos.: 88631

Bid Solicitation

Date: 3/15/23 

Group J

Group E

Group F

Group G

Group H

Group I

L & t Auto Repair Morgan Park Auto Service Inc. Park View Automotive Roesch Ford Terry's Ford

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
PU-04.01-I-Rev0



Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

No Bid No Bid No Bid $796,189.50 $796,189.50 No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $796,189.50 $796,189.50 $397,880.00 $397,880.00 $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid $432,737.50 $432,737.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid $432,737.50 $432,737.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

$468,797.50 No Bid No Bid $796,189.50 $796,189.50 $397,880.00 $397,880.00 $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid $432,737.50 $432,737.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $796,189.50 $796,189.50 No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

No Bid $432,737.50 $432,737.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $370,850.00 $370,850.00 

$468,797.50 Total Price $1,730,950.00 Total Price $3,184,758.00 Total Price $795,760.00 Total Price $3,708,500.00 

Triangle Auto Service Van Dam Auto Repair URT E&R Towing, Inc. Wentworth Tire ServiceTerry's Ford

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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