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Grand Total:

Bid Solicitation     
Date: 1/23/2024 

Award by Group 4

Award by Group 5

$5,120,000.00 

Total Price Total Price Total Price

$883,800.00 

Item Description

Award by Group 1

Award by Group 2

Award by Group 3

BID TABULATION

CAF S.A. Lucchini North 
America, Inc. Utcras

Bid Open  
Date:  3/6/2024Description: Locomotive Wheel Plates  IFB No. 123086B

Total Price Total Price

$5,532,000.00 $4,499,960.00 

$350,400.00 

$384,200.00 

$189,100.00 
No Bid

$762,000.00 

$308,672.00 

$383,176.00 

$181,500.00 

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
PU-04.01-I-Rev0

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$5,120,000.00 $7,339,500.00 $6,135,308.00 
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