
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1
$3,570,000.00 $3,880,000.00 $3,361,906.00 $3,333,000.00 $4,063,998.00 

2
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

4
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

8
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

9
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Total Price $3,570,000.00 Total Price $3,880,000.00 Total Price $3,361,906.00 Total Price $3,333,000.00 Total Price $4,063,998.00 

Item Description

Grand Total

Bid Open Date: 6/23/2020

BID TABULATION [1 of 2]

BIDDER: Bowa Construction Drive Construction Inc. GMA Construction Group Kandu Construction Inc. The George Sollitt 
Construction Company

Description:  Construction Services for the 10th Floor
Remodeling at 547 W. Jackson Boulevard, Chicago, IL 60661 IFB No.: 63633 Bid Solicitation Date: 5/19/2020

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
PU-04.01-I-Rev0 Page 1 of 4



Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

$2,904,000.00 $3,337,000.00 $3,995,935.00 $3,625,273.00 $3,560,000.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Total Price $2,904,000.00 Total Price $3,337,000.00 Total Price $3,995,935.00 Total Price $3,625,273.00 Total Price $3,560,000.00 

Apex Construction Group, Inc. Lo Destro Construction CompanyMaster Design Build, LLC Burling Builders, Inc. Accel Construction Services 
Group, LLC

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1
$3,659,000.00 $3,837,000.00 $3,499,000.00 $3,726,800.00 $3,487,697.00 

2
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

4
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

8
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

9
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Total Price $3,659,000.00 Total Price $3,837,000.00 Total Price $3,499,000.00 Total Price $3,726,800.00 Total Price $3,487,697.00 

Item Description

Grand Total

Bid Open Date: 6/23/2020

BID TABULATION [2 of 2]

BIDDER: Powers & Sons Construction 
Company, Inc. K.R. Miller Contractors, Inc. ALL Construction Group Friedler Construction Company IHC Construction Companies, LLC

Description:  Construction Services for the 10th Floor
Remodeling at 547 W. Jackson Boulevard, Chicago, IL 60661 IFB No.: 63633 Bid Solicitation Date: 5/19/2020

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

$3,372,945.00 $3,786,500.00 No Bid No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Total Price $3,372,945.00 Total Price $3,786,500.00 Total Price No Bid Total Price No Bid

Wight Construction Services, Inc.W.E. O'Neil Construction Co. F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen & 
Associates LLC Scale Construction Inc.

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only; a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.
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