Meﬂa BID TABULATION
Description: Vehicle & Equipment Sale IFB No.: 71189 g:’s‘ﬂ;ﬁﬂ"; Nos.: N/A g'a‘fg;;‘“ 6
BIDDER:| TMRS Enterprises, Inc.

Line [ QY. Ttem Description Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | _Total _| Unit Price | _Total | Unit Price | _Total | Unit Price | _Total
vt Unit# 08302 $661.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
2]t Unit# 91083 $601.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
s Unit# 91062 $1511.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
ct Unit# 08303 901,00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
° 1t Unit# 91191 $1,001.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
et Unit# 91091 $669.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
Tt Unit#91052 $1,869.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
&t unit# 91224 $501.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
ot unit# 11022 $369.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
ot Unit# 91116 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
nt Unit #0003 $301.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
2]t unit# 11015 5339.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
Bt Unit#11013 $601.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
e unit# 11016 $769.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
Bt Unit #1031 $1,200.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
w]t unit# 11012 $889.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
s Unit #1032 $1,200.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
e Unit# 05040 $1,601.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
Wt Unit #1025 $700.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
o]t Unit# 05041 $881.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
2t Unit# 15405 $309.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
2|t Unit# 90689 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
#t Unit#91235 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
)t Unit# 06005 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
M Unit# 06215 $311.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
®]t Unit# 06007 5301.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
ot Unit# 90902 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
2] Unit #07041 $1,703.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
»t Uit # 500211 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
o]t unit# 500176 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00
st Unit# NIA No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
2]t Unit# 500214 No-Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
B Uit #500042 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
]t Unit#500099 No-Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
# Uit #500051 $101.00 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
*]t Unit#500043 510100 $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
it Uit # 500044 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 50.00
®|t Unit#500089 No-Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
9L Unit #500047 No-Bid $0.00 50.00 $0.00 $0.00

Total Price | $19,390.00fotal Price 50.00|Total Price $0.00|Total Price 50.00[Total Price | 30.00
Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a and must be performed.



