etia BID TABULATION
R . . Bid Solicitation R . Bid Open
Description: Sales of Scrap Vehicles (1 of 4) IFB Nos.: 71146 Date: 12/04/15 Specification Nos.: N/A Date: 1/05/16
Line [Qty. Item Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Total Total Unit Price Total
1 1 veh 02000 . .
No-Bid No-Bid $609.00 $150.00 $401.55 $400.00
2 1 veh 02003 .
No-Bid $1,010.00 $309.00 $150.00 $701.55 $400.00
3 1 veh 07018 .
No-Bid $801.00 $1,809.00 $150.00 $1,755.55 $1,500.00
4 1 veh 07038 .
No-Bid $850.00 $1,909.00 $150.00 $1,801.55 $1,500.00
5 1 veh 08301 )
No-Bid $460.00 $1,009.00 $150.00 $1,855.55 $1,000.00
6 1 veh 11302 . . i
No-Bid No-Bid $309.00 $150.00 $1,055.55 No-Bid
7 1 veh 90687, . .
$1,000.00 $651.00 $609.00 $200.00 No-Bid No-Bid
8 1 veh 90903 . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $109.00 $150.00 $55.55 No-Bid
9 1 veh 91007, .
No-Bid $701.00 $309.00 $150.00 $301.55 $400.00
10

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.



etra: BID TABULATION
L . . Bid Solicitation A . Bid Open
Description: Sales of Scrap Vehicles (2 of 4) IFB Nos.: 71146 Date: 12/04/15 Specification Nos.: N/A Date: 1/05/16

Line |Qty. Item Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
10 1 veh 91019

No-Bid $601.00 $309.00 $150.00 $601.55 $400.00
11 1 veh 91023 . .

No-Bid No-Bid $339.00 $150.00 $701.55 $400.00
12 1 veh 91024 .

No-Bid $875.00 $339.00 $150.00 $701.55 $400.00
13 1 veh 91035 )

$1,000.00 $701.00 $403.00 $200.00 No-Bid $400.00

14 1 veh 91063 .

No-Bid $1,700.00 $603.00 $200.00 $1,455.55 $300.00
15 1 veh 91065 X

No-Bid $875.00 $309.00 $150.00 $855.55 $350.00
16 1 veh 91070 .

No-Bid $800.00 $209.00 $150.00 $755.55 $300.00
17 1 veh 91071 . .

No-Bid No-Bid $403.00 $150.00 $501.55 $300.00
18 1 veh 91084 i .

No-Bid No-Bid $403.00 $150.00 $501.55 $300.00

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.



etra-

e

BID TABULATION

Description: Sales of Scrap Vehicles (3 of 4)

IFB Nos.: 71146

Bid Solicitation
Date: 12/04/15

Specification Nos.: N/A

Bid Open
Date: 1/05/16

Line |Qty. Item Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
19 veh 91135 .
No-Bid $890.00 $809.00 $150.00 $401.55 $250.00
20 veh 91192 .
No-Bid $680.00 $609.00 $150.00 $501.55 $250.00
21 veh 91198 .
No-Bid $225.00 $409.00 $150.00 $501.55 $300.00
22 veh 91200 .
No-Bid $225.00 $409.00 $150.00 $101.55 $300.00
23 veh 91201 . .
No-Bid No-Bid $619.00 $150.00 $401.55 $300.00
24 veh 91207, . .
No-Bid No-Bid $619.00 $150.00 $501.55 $300.00
25 veh 91209 . .
No-Bid No-Bid $409.00 $150.00 $601.55 $300.00
26 veh 91219 .
No-Bid $850.00 $609.00 $150.00 $601.55 $300.00
27 veh 91220 .
No-Bid $801.00 $609.00 $150.00 $501.55 $300.00

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.




MELIa

BID TABULATION

S . . Bid Solicitation R . Bid Open
Description: Sales of Scrap Vehicles (4 of 4) IFB Nos.: 71146 Date: 12/04/15 Specification Nos.: N/A Date: 1/05/16
] B & W TTUCK AMErTcan vvaste ONIea Road Towmag, | nna's Builaing Scrap IVietal Services, |
BIDDER: Repair,Inc. Industries, Inc. TMRS Enterprises Inc. Maintenance LLC
Line |Qty. Item Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
28 1 veh 91234 .
No-Bid $499.00 $609.00 $150.00 $601.55 $300.00
29 1 veh 500021 . . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $39.00 $10.00 No-Bid No-Bid
30 1 veh 500058 . . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $39.00 $10.00 No-Bid No-Bid
31 1 veh 500073 . . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $39.00 No-Bid $201.55 No-Bid
32 1 veh 500088 . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $909.00 No-Bid $101.55 $200.00
33 1 veh 500095 . . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $39.00 No-Bid $201.55 No-Bid
34 1 veh 500105 . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $909.00 No-Bid $51.55 $200.00
35 1 veh 500176 . . . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $309.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid
36 1 veh 500211 . . . . .
No-Bid No-Bid $39.00 No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.



