
Line Qty. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 1
$50,120.00 No-Bid $19,936,000.00 $20,911,000.00 $17,235,000.00 $20,772,084.62 $40,700,000.00 $18,995,000.00 No-Bid

2 1
$0.00 $86,000.00 No-Bid No-Bid $17,875,000.00 16,800.000.00 $25,075,000.00 No-Bid $15,475,000.00 

3 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

4 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

8 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

9 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Total Price $50,120.00 Total Price $86,000.00 Total Price $19,936,000.00 Total Price $20,911,000.00 Total Price $35,110,000.00 Total Price $20,772,084.62 Total Price $65,775,000.00 Total Price $18,995,000.00 Total Price $15,475,000.00 

Superior Construction Co. F.H. Paschen Dunnet Bay Construction CO. IHC Construction Co.

BID TABULATION

BIDDER: Bird Solutions Fireco, Inc. Kenny Construction Co. Lorig Construction Co. Jude Lau

Bid Open
Date: 05/03/17Specification Nos.:  N/ADescription:  Group I - UP-N Bridges; Group II - Ravenswood 

Station
IFB No. 39226 Bid Solicitation

Date: 03/07/17 

Item Description

GROUP I - BRIDGES

GROUP II - RAVENSWOOD STATION

Pricing read at the bid opening is for informational purposes only, a responsiveness and responsibility determination must be performed.


